RE: Summerfields Section 106 Funds

From: Stuart Wallace

Sent: Friday, 12 August, 15:31

Hi Lisa
The value currently available is £21,950.67

The two schemes linked to Summerfield are below:

Amouint buel Amount ; Date payment Data {0 be
Bfts Address Paid At Amotimt Rematning ity
O Churchtown Fasm, Farmn Lane, S 2y &
X 03
o 5, Sahash £21,95067 a £21,950.67 03-Jun-21 -Jure 26
Land to the West of 6 Chutchiown Drive, St :
Stephens, Comwat, PLY2 4B Mot received Q Status of deyelopment not known

Many thanks

Stuart Wallace

Public Siace Officer

From:
Sent:
To: St
Subject: Summerfields Section 106 Funds

GAUTION: This is an EXTERNAL email which was sent from
outside of Cornwall Council's netwark. Do not click links, open
attachments, or reply unless you recognise the sender and know
the content is safe. Do not provide any login or password details

if requested.

Hi Stuart

I hope this finds you well.



Would it be possible to have confirmation of the $106
amount that is availabie for us at all so that we can useit
for match funding applications?

Best Wish_es

Chair - Friend's of Summerfields Park
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